

BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER

STATE OF MARYLAND

***** STATE OF MARYLAND *****

BPO NO: 001B6600041

PRINT DATE: 07/03/25

PAGE: 01

SHIP TO:

AS SPECIFIED ON INDIVIDUAL ORDERS

VENDOR ID:

PPC LUBRICANTS
305 MICRO DR

JONESTOWN, PA
(800)772-5823

17038

REFER QUESTIONS TO:

MATTHEW SMITH
(410)767-3039
MATTHEW.SMITH2@MARYLAND.GOV

ITB: DGSR5600026

EXPR DATE: 07/01/28
POST DATE: 07/02/25

DISCOUNT TERMS: .
CONTRACT AMOUNT:

NET 30 DAY
.00

TERMS:

ARTICLES HEREIN ARE EXEMPT FROM MARYLAND SALES AND USE TAXES BY EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE NUMBER 3000256-3 AND FROM FEDERAL EXCISE TAXES BY EXEMPTION NUMBER 52-73-0358K. IT IS THE VENDOR'S RESPONSIBILITY TO ADVISE COMMON CARRIERS THAT AGENCIES OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND ARE EXEMPT FROM TRANSPORTATION TAX.

STATEWIDE CONTRACT FOR OILS, GREASE AND LUBRICANTS

THIS IS A THREE (3) YEAR CONTRACT EFFECTIVE 7/2/2025 THROUGH 7/1/2028 WITH TWO (2) ONE-YEAR RENEWAL OPTIONS.

THIS IS AN INDEFINITE DELIVERY INDEFINITE QUANTITY CONTRACT. REFER TO ATTACHED PRICING LIST FOR REGION, BRAND AND UNIT OF MEASUREMENT.

VENDOR CONTACT: SHIHEDA IRBY
VENDOR EMAIL: SHIHEDA.IRBY@RELADYNE.COM
VENDOR PHONE: 800-772-5823 EXT 3708

THIS IS A REQUIREMENT BASED CONTRACT TO SUPPLY THE STATE OF MARYLAND AND ITS USING AGENCIES WITH ITS NEEDS FOR OILS, GREASE AND LUBRICANTS.

THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE GOVERNED BY THE LAWS OF MD.

THIS CONTRACT DOES NOT OBLIGATE THE STATE OF MARYLAND TO PURCHASE ANY MINIMUM OR MAXIMUM QUANTITY THROUGHOUT THE CONTRACT PERIOD. ORDERS FOR ACTUAL REQUIREMENTS MAY BE MORE OR LESS THAN LISTED AND WILL BE PLACED DIRECTLY TO THE SUPPLIER BY THE USING AGENCIES.

DELIVERY: PRODUCTS SHOULD BE DELIVERED AS EXPEDITIOUSLY AS POSSIBLE

*** CONTINUED, NEXT PAGE ***

BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER

STATE OF MARYLAND

***** STATE OF MARYLAND *****

BPO NO: 001B6600041

PRINT DATE: 07/03/25

PAGE: 02

TERMS (cont'd):

BUT WITHIN FIVE (5) DAYS UPON RECEIPT OF ORDERS FROM USING AGENCIES. F.O.B. DELIVERED INCLUDING BULK OIL DELIVERIES TO THE MARYLAND TRANSIT ADMINISTRATION (MTA) AND MARYLAND TRANSPORTATION AUTHORITY (MDTA) DELIVERY POINTS, AS DESCRIBED BELOW, AND OTHER USING AGENCIES' BULK DELIVERY POINTS THROUGHOUT THE STATE OF MARYLAND.

REGIONS & COUNTIES:

REGION 1: DORCHESTER, WICOMICO, SOMERSET, WORCESTER
REGION 2: CAROLINE, KENT, TALBOT, CECIL, QUEEN ANNE'S
REGION 3: HARFORD, BALTIMORE CITY, BALTIMORE, ANNE ARUNDE
REGION 4: PRINCE GEORGE'S, CALVERT, CHARLES, ST. MARY'S
REGION 5: HOWARD, MONTGOMERY, FREDERICK, CARROLL
REGION 6: GARRETT, ALLEGANY, WASHINGTON

VENDOR SHALL HAVE AGENCY CONTACT PERSON CONFIRM TANK LOCATION AND SIGN DELIVERY TICKET.

THE VENDOR SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL FEDERAL AND STATE OSHA REGULATIONS, STATE OF MARYLAND PROCUREMENT REGULATIONS IN EFFECT AT THE TIME OF SUBMISSION AND THE INSTRUCTIONS PROVIDED HEREIN.

USAGE REPORT:

A REPORT SHALL BE FURNISHED BY THE SUCCESSFUL CONTRACTOR EVERY HUNDRED -TWENTY (120) DAYS DETAILING THE PURCHASE OF ALL ITEMS ON THE CONTRACT. THE REPORT SHALL BE SUBMITTED ELECTRONICALLY IN EXCEL FORMAT. AS A MINIMUM, THE REPORT SHALL REFLECT THE CONTRACT NUMBER, CONTRACT ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION, THE DOLLAR VOLUME PURCHASED OF EACH ITEM, AGENCY IDENTIFICATION, AND THE CONTRACT TOTAL. THE REPORT SHALL BE FILED WITHIN THIRTY (30) DAYS AFTER THE END OF EACH REPORT PERIOD. ANY EXCEPTION TO THIS MANDATORY REQUIREMENT MAY RESULT IN CANCELLATION OF THE AWARD. FAILURE TO PROVIDE THE REPORT WITH THE MINIMUM REQUIRED INFORMATION MAY ALSO NEGATE ANY CONTRACT EXTENSION CLAUSES. THE USAGE REPORT SHALL BE EMAILED TO: DGS.STATEWIDECONTRACTSUSAGEREPORT@MARYLAND.GOV.

ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE:

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL PAY AN ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE TO THE STATE IN THE AMOUNT OF ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE TOTAL CONTRACT SALES. THE ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE IS CALCULATED BASED ON ALL SALES TRANSACTED UNDER THE CONTRACT, MINUS ANY RETURNS OR CREDITS. THE ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE SHALL NOT BE CHARGED DIRECTLY TO THE CUSTOMER, E.G. AS A SEPARATE LINE ITEM, FEE OR SURCHARGE, BUT SHALL BE INCLUDED IN THE CONTRACT'S UNIT PRICES.

2. THE ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE SHALL BE SUBMITTED TO THE DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES, FISCAL SERVICES DIVISION, 301 W. PRESTON STREET, ROOM 1309, BALTIMORE, MD 21201, THIRTY (30) DAYS

*** CONTINUED, NEXT PAGE ***

BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER

STATE OF MARYLAND

***** STATE OF MARYLAND *****

BPO NO: 001B6600041

PRINT DATE: 07/03/25

PAGE: 03

TERMS (cont'd):

AFTER THE END OF EACH REPORTING PERIOD ALONG WITH A MONTHLY USAGE REPORT DOCUMENTING ALL CONTRACT SALES. AN EXCEL VERSION OF THE MONTHLY USAGE REPORT SHALL BE EMAILED TO DGS.STATEWIDECONTRACTSUSAGEREPORT@MARYLAND.GOV.

3. FAILURE TO REMIT TRANSACTION FEES IN A TIMELY MANNER OR REMITTANCE OF FEES INCONSISTENT WITH THE CONTRACT'S REQUIREMENTS MAY RESULT IN THE STATE EXERCISING ALL RECOURSES AVAILABLE UNDER THE CONTRACT INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, A THIRD PARTY AUDIT OF ALL CONTRACT ACTIVITY. SHOULD AN AUDIT BE REQUIRED BY THE STATE, THE CONTRACTOR SHALL REIMBURSE THE STATE FOR ALL COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE AUDIT UP TO \$10,000.00 OR ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE CONTRACT'S ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE, WHICHEVER IS HIGHER.

4. PRIOR TO AWARD, CONTRACTORS WILL BE ASKED TO CONFIRM, IN WRITING, THAT THEIR UNIT PRICES INCLUDE THE ONE PERCENT ELECTRONIC TRANSACTION FEE.

PURCHASES BY OTHER ENTITIES - INDEFINITE QUANTITY CONTRACTS: THIS PROVISION APPLIES TO INDEFINITE QUANTITY CONTRACTS.

- A. PURSUANT TO THE STATE FINANCE AND PROCUREMENT ARTICLE, SECTION 13-110 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND, EXCEPT FOR ENTITIES DESCRIBED IN (6)(A), THE FOLLOWING ENTITIES MAY PURCHASE MATERIALS, SUPPLIES, AND EQUIPMENT UNDER THIS CONTRACT:
- (1) A COUNTY OR BALTIMORE CITY;
 - (2) A MUNICIPAL CORPORATION;
 - (3) A GOVERNMENTAL AGENCY IN THE STATE;
 - (4) A PUBLIC OR QUASI-PUBLIC AGENCY THAT:
 - (I) RECEIVES STATE MONEY; AND
 - (II) IS EXEMPT FROM TAXATION UNDER SECTION 501(C)(3) OF THE INTERNAL REVENUE CODE;
 - (5) A PRIVATE ELEMENTARY OR SECONDARY SCHOOL THAT
 - (I) EITHER HAS BEEN ISSUED A CERTIFICATE OF APPROVAL FROM THE STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION OR IS ACCREDITED BY THE ASSOCIATION OF INDEPENDENT SCHOOLS; AND
 - (II) IS EXEMPT FROM TAXATION UNDER SECTION 501(C)(3) OF THE INTERNAL REVENUE CODE ; OR
 - (6) A NON-PUBLIC INSTITUTION OF HIGHER EDUCATION UNDER SECTION 17-106 OF THE EDUCATION ARTICLE.
 - (I) A PRIVATE ELEMENTARY OR SECONDARY SCHOOL OR A NONPUBLIC INSTITUTION OF HIGHER EDUCATION MAY NOT PURCHASE RELIGIOUS MATERIALS UNDER THIS CONTRACT.
 - (II) THE RIGHT TO PURCHASE UNDER THIS SECTION SHALL BE IN ADDITION TO, BUT NOT IN SUBSTITUTION FOR, THE APPLICABLE PURCHASING POWER GRANTED TO ANY OF THE LISTED ENTITIES PURSUANT TO ANY STATUTORY OR CHARTER PROVISION.
 - (7) ANOTHER STATE OR AN AGENCY OR OTHER INSTRUMENTALITY OF ANOTHER

*** CONTINUED, NEXT PAGE ***

BLANKET PURCHASE ORDER

STATE OF MARYLAND

***** STATE OF MARYLAND *****

BPO NO: 001B6600041

PRINT DATE: 07/03/25

PAGE: 04

TERMS (cont'd):

STATE.

ALL PURCHASES UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY ANY SUCH ENTITY AS DESCRIBED ABOVE WHICH IS NOT A UNIT OR AGENCY OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND FOR WHICH THE STATE OF MARYLAND MAY BE HELD LIABLE IN CONTRACT: (1) SHALL CONSTITUTE A PURCHASE OR CONTRACT BETWEEN THE CONTRACTOR AND ENTITY ONLY; (2) SHALL NOT CONSTITUTE A PURCHASE OR CONTRACT OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND; (3) SHALL NOT BE BINDING OR ENFORCEABLE AGAINST THE STATE OF MARYLAND OR ANY OF ITS USING AGENCIES; AND (4) MAY BE SUBJECT TO OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS AGREED TO BY THE CONTRACTOR AND THE PURCHASER.

CONTRACTOR BEARS THE RISK OF DETERMINING WHETHER OR NOT ANY ENTITY FROM WHICH THE CONTRACTOR RECEIVES AN ORDER UNDER THE CONTRACT IS A UNIT OR AGENCY OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND SUCH THAT THE CONTRACT MAY BE ENFORCED AGAINST THE STATE OF MARYLAND.

THE BIDDER'S EXECUTION AND SUBMISSION OF A RESPONSIVE BID CONSTITUTES A PROMISE BY THE BIDDER TO PERFORM THE CONTRACT SOLICITED BY THE DEPARTMENT IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS STATED IN THE SOLICITATION. THE BID SHALL BE IRREVOCABLE FOR THE PERIOD STATED IN THE SOLICITATION OR FOR SUCH LONGER PERIOD AS THE BIDDER AND DEPARTMENT MAY AGREE.

THE DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES' "TERMS AND CONDITIONS FOR COMMODITY CONTRACTS OVER \$100,000" AND ALL SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SOLICITATION# BPM048024 / DGSR5600026 INCORPORATED HEREIN BY REFERENCE.

0001

40524

EA

GREASE, LUBRICATION TYPE
VARIOUS OILS, GREASE AND LUBRICANTS
SEE ATTACHED FOR PRODUCT LIST AND PRICING

END OF ITEM LIST

***** LAST PAGE *****

AUTHORIZED BY: Charles W. Bailey

DATE: 7/7/25

BUYER AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE

REGION	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE (UOM)	UNIT PRICE	MFG	BRAND	MODEL	MAKE	ALTERNATE UOM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2-2, EP, GC-CLB	1	120 lb. Keg	\$529.00	DYRENE	120 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	120 LB KEG
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2-2, EP, GC-CLB	1	400 lb. Keg	\$1,688.00	DYRENE	400 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	400 LB DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2-2, EP, GC-CLB	1	12 Cartridges per Case (14 oz. ea.)	\$48.47	DYRENE	10 1 DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	10 TUBES TO A CASE
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$47.75	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$455.40	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W-40 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W-40 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	5 gal. Pail	\$55.90	DYRENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	Per Gal	\$9.91	DYRENE	BULK DRYDENE DIESEL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 30W Diesel and Gasoline Engine	1	55 gal. Drum	\$590.70	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEL 30W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	1	5 gal. Pail	\$61.30	DYRENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	1	55 gal. Drum	\$642.40	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	1	55 gal. Drum	\$642.95	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL TTD10-4 30W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	1	55 gal. Drum	\$667.15	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL TTD10-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	1	5 gal. Pail	\$189.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SAE ATF A668	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	1	55 gal. Drum	\$1,711.05	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SAE ATF A668	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	1	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	1	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	5 gal. Pail	\$43.50	DYRENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$6.60	DYRENE	BULK DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	5 gal. Pail	\$43.50	DYRENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GAI PAI
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DYRENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 1 - Dorchester, Somerset, Wisconsin, Worcester	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	5 gal. Pail</						

Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$642.95	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$667.15	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	5 gal. Pail	\$189.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	55 gal. Drum	\$1,711.05	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	121 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$43.50	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$6.60	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$44.75	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$44.75	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 68 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$460.55	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 68 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	5 gal. Pail	\$50.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	55 gal. Drum	\$525.25	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$8.03	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	5 gal. Pail	\$53.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	55 gal. Drum	\$704.00	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil Motor 2 Cycle Gasoline Engine (Lawn Mowers, Snowblowers, Chainsaws; Outboard Motors)	Quart	\$32.51	MAG 1	61 QT MAG1 2 CYCLE TC-W3	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	61 QUART
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	5 gal. Bucket	\$83.90	MAG 1	5 GAL MAG1 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	120 lb. Keg	\$242.88	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL MP 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEAT (120 LBS)
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	Quart	\$44.34	DRYDENE	61 QT DRYDENE GEARALL SYN 75W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	61 QUART
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	5 gal. Pail	\$134.90	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL SYN 75W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	5 gal. Pail	\$125.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	120 lb. Keg	\$313.92	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEAT (120 LBS)
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 3 - Anne Arundel, Baltimore, Harford, Baltimore City	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	120 lb. Keg	\$529.00	DRYDENE	120 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	120LB KEG
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	400 lb. Keg	\$1,688.00	DRYDENE	400 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	400 LB DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	12 Cartridges per Case (14 oz. ea.)	\$48.47	DRYDENE	101 DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	100 TUBES TO A CASE
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$47.15	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$455.40	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	5 gal. Pail	\$55.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	Per Gal	\$9.91	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	Per Gal	\$9.91	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 30W Diesel and Gasoline Engine	55 gal. Drum	\$590.70	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 30W Diesel and Gasoline Engine	5 gal. Pail	\$62.40	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	55 gal. Drum	\$642.40	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$642.95	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$667.15	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	5 gal. Pail	\$189.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	55 gal. Drum	\$1,711.05	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	121 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$43.50	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$6.60	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$44.75	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	5 gal. Pail	\$44.75	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 68 AW	55 gal. Drum	\$460.55	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 68 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	5 gal. Pail	\$50.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	55 gal. Drum	\$525.25	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$8.03	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE TRANSAL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	5 gal. Pail	\$53.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	55 gal. Drum	\$704.00	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil Motor 2 Cycle Gasoline Engine (Lawn Mowers, Snowblowers, Chainsaws; Outboard Motors)	Quart	\$32.51	MAG 1	61 QT MAG1 2 CYCLE TC-W3	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	61 QUART
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	5 gal. Bucket	\$83.90	MAG 1	5 GAL MAG1 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	120 lb. Keg	\$242.88	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL MP 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEAT (120 LBS)
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	Quart	\$44.34	DRYDENE	61 QT DRYDENE GEARALL SYN 75W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	61 QUART
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90 API GL-5	5 gal. Pail	\$134.90	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W90	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	5 gal. Pail	\$125.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	120 lb. Keg	\$313.92	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEAT (120 LBS)
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 4 - Calvert, Charles, Prince George's, St. Mary's	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	120 lb. Keg	\$529.00	DRYDENE	120 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	120LB KEG
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	400 lb. Keg	\$1,688.00	DRYDENE	400 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	400 LB DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGL2, EP, GC-LB	12 Cartridges per Case (14 oz. ea.)	\$48.47	DRYDENE	101 DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	100 TUBES TO A CASE
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	Per Gal	\$7.17	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	5 gal. Pail	\$47.15	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	55 gal. Drum	\$455.40	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	5 gal. Pail	\$55.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	Per Gal	\$9.91	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	Per Gal	\$9.91	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE DIESEALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 30W Diesel and Gasoline Engine	55 gal. Drum	\$590.70	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive Engine Automatic Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	5 gal. Pail	\$62.40	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESEALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$642.95	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Transmission Oil Fluid, SAE 30	55 gal. Drum	\$667.15	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSAL TDDT-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	5 gal. Pail	\$189.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	55 gal. Drum	\$1,711.05	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL SPIRAX SB ATF A68	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.66	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	121 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Automatic Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery								

Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil Gear Multipurpose Grade 80W90 API GL-5	1	5 gal. Bucket	\$83.90	MAG 1	5 GAL MAG1 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil Gear Multipurpose Grade 80W90 API GL-6	1	120 lb. Keg	\$542.88	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL MP 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEG (120 LBS)
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90	1	Quart	\$42.44	DRYDENE	6/1 QT DRYDENE GEARALL SYN 75W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	6/1 QUART
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90	1	5 gal. Pail	\$213.00	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE SYN 75W90	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	1	5 gal. Pail	\$125.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	1	120 lb. Keg	\$553.92	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEG (120 LBS)
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 5 - Carroll, Frederick, Howard, Montgomery	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$7.37	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGLJ-2, EP, GC-LB	1	120 lb. Keg	\$529.00	DRYDENE	120 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	120 LB KEG
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGLJ-2, EP, GC-LB	1	400 lb. Keg	\$1,488.00	DRYDENE	400 LB DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	400 LB DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Grease Lubricants, Lithium Complex, High Temperature, NGLJ-2, EP, GC-LB	1	12 Cartridges per Case (14 oz. ea.)	\$48.47	DRYDENE	10/1 DRYDENE RETRAPLEX RUBY PLUS EP 2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	10 TUBES TO A CASE
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-20 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal	\$7.37	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W20	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$37.41	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal	\$7.37	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$47.15	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 10W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$455.40	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 10W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 GAL DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W-40 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W-40 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	5 gal. Pail	\$51.30	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESELALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	55 gal. Drum	\$581.90	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESELALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Motor, SAE 15W-40 Diesel	1	Per Gal	\$9.91	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE DIESELALL FLEET SB 15W40	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automotive Oil, SAE 30W Diesel and Gasoline Engine	1	55 gal. Drum	\$596.70	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESELALL 30W CF-2	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automotive Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	1	5 gal. Pail	\$61.30	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE DIESELALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, Engine Automotive Oil, SAE 40W Diesel Engine	1	55 gal. Drum	\$642.40	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE DIESELALL 40W CF-4SG	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Transmission Oil/Fluid, SAE 30	1	55 gal. Drum	\$642.95	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL 30W CF-4 30W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Transmission Oil/Fluid, SAE 50	1	55 gal. Drum	\$667.15	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL TITFO-4 50W	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	1	5 gal. Pail	\$189.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL SPIRAX 56 ATF A668	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Transmission Fluid, Full Synthetic, Allison Transmission	1	55 gal. Drum	\$1,711.05	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL SPIRAX 56 ATF A668	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Automotive Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.46	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12/1 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Automotive Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic	1	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Automotive Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	1	Case of 12; Quart Containers	\$54.46	DURAMAX	12/1 QT DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	12 QUARTS PER CASE
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Automotive Transmission Fluid, Automatic, Synthetic, Low Viscosity	1	55 gal. Drum	\$754.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	5 gal. Pail	\$42.50	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 32 AW	1	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$6.60	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE RADIAS AW 32 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	5 gal. Pail	\$43.50	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 46 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW	1	5 gal. Pail	\$44.75	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 68 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 68 AW	1	55 gal. Drum	\$460.35	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE RADIAS AW 68 HYDRAULIC	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	1	5 gal. Pail	\$50.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	1	55 gal. Drum	\$525.25	DRYDENE	55 GAL DRYDENE TRANSALL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, Universal Tractor, Designed for Use as Lubricant for Tractor Transmission	1	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$8.03	DRYDENE	BULK DRYDENE TRANSALL TRACTOR FLUID	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	1	5 gal. Pail	\$53.75	SHELL	5 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46 AW Non-Conductive for Electrical Services	1	55 gal. Drum	\$578.00	SHELL	55 GAL SHELL TELLUS S2 VX 46	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil Motor 2 Cycle Gasoline Engine (Lawn Mowers, Snowmobiles, Chainsaws, Outboard Motors)	1	Quart	\$32.51	MAG 1	6/1 QT MAG1 2 CYCLE TC-W3	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	6/1 QUART
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil Gear Multipurpose Grade 80W90 API GL-5	1	5 gal. Bucket	\$83.90	MAG 1	5 GAL MAG1 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil Gear Multipurpose Grade 80W90 API GL-6	1	120 lb. Keg	\$542.88	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL MP 80W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEG (120 LBS)
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90	1	Quart	\$42.44	DRYDENE	6/1 QT DRYDENE GEARALL SYN 75W90 GL-5	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	6/1 QUART
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-90	1	5 gal. Pail	\$113.00	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE SYN 75W90	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	1	5 gal. Pail	\$125.65	DRYDENE	5 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Gear Multipurpose, Synthetic, Limited Slip Grade 75W-140	1	120 lb. Keg	\$553.92	DRYDENE	16 GAL DRYDENE GEARALL ELITE 75W140	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	16 G KEG (120 LBS)
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	5 gal. Pail	\$46.35	DURAMAX	5 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	5 GA PAIL
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	55 gal. Drum	\$446.60	DURAMAX	55 GAL DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	55 G DRUM
Region 6 - Allegany, Garrett, Washington	Oil, Automotive, SAE 5W-30 Synthetic Blend	1	Per Gal (anticipated delivery of 100 gal.)	\$7.37	DURAMAX	BULK DURAMAX SB 5W30	PDS PROVIDED	PDS PROVIDED	BULK